
From Rafael Tovar
To: Gary Copeland
Cc: Church of Christ in Harvest, AL that meets on Kelly Spring Road

September 2023

Good evening, dear brothers and sisters all. Receive the peace of 
our Lord Jesus Christ. Giving thanks to God, Father for the 
communion between you and us, grateful for your love and 
support for all the people of God in Barinas, and giving thanks to 
God for the beautiful communion we have in Christ Jesus, I present 
some of the activities carried out in the month of September. 

We have faithfully fulfilled the divine commandment Sunday after 
Sunday, and we have preached the gospel in different parts of our 
city. Thanks to God and brother Gary, we have met a good brother 
and evangelist, Jorge Carmona, through email and WhatsApp who 
helped us with a course on preparing evangelists. Thanks to this 
teaching, the churches of Christ will each have their own 
evangelist, and will in turn prepare more evangelists to continue 
the work of forming new congregations with the desire that each 
church in the future would have elders as our Lord has established 
through the scriptures. We are studying on Tuesday and Saturday 
at 5 pm with a number of brothers from Barinas, Venezuela. It was 
also possible to reach many brothers in different states of 
Venezuela and other countries. Thanks to these teachings we have 
managed to clarify more and more the powerful gospel of our Lord 
Jesus Christ, following the teachings of Ephesians 4:11, Acts 2:18 
and 2 Timothy 4:5. We ask for your prayers so that this course 
reaches every corner of every town, state, country where there is a 
congregation of Christ so that we all do according to the model that 
God has given to establish churches of Christ.

Rafael Tovar.
Preacher in La Floresta
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Study among the brethren
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